Charles Lindsey
Bid Tabulation #20-22 ""Sewer Manhole Components™

lindseyc@jccal.org

Grand Total: $18,020.00 $0.00
MANUFACTURER & Negotiation
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION PRODUCT # UoM PRICE l§ricing

48 " SANITARY MANHOLE (0'- 6' DEEP) TO
1 INCLUDE BASE AND ONE 12" OPENING 4886.05P EACH $2,600.00

48" SANITARY MANHOLE RISERS AND CONES

(OVER 6' DEEP OR RISERS ONLY, NO BASE 48R1.00S.LS VERT. FT $340.00
2 SECTION)
3 48" FLAT SLAB TOP (6' THICK) 48T6.27 EACH $728.00

CON-SEAL CS 231 (14'6" ROLL REQUIRED PER MAS.375.CS *8 boxes $35.00
4 JOINT)
5 4" MANHOLE BOOTS S106-8MWP-EX EACH $80.00
6 8" MANHOLE BOOTS S5106-12WP-EX EACH $100.00
7 10" MANHOLE BOOTS S406116BWP-EX EACH $130.00
8 12" MANHOLE BOOTS S106-16AWP-EX EACH $140.00
9 16" MANHOLE BOOTS S5106-20WS EACH $160.00
10 18" MANHOLE BOOTS S5206-22 EACH $190.00
11 7" TO 12" CORES NO BID EACH $0.00
12 16" TO 20" CORES NO BID EACH $0.00
13 24" TO 28" CORES NO BID EACH $0.00
14 2 FT. CONE 48CC2.0H26.LS EACH $680.00
15 3 FT. CONE 48CC.026.LS EACH $1,020.00
16 4 FT. CONE NO BID EACH $0.00
17 2 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER 48B2.00SLS EACH $1,182.00
18 3 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER 48B3.00S.LS EACH $1,519.00
19 4 FT. BASE, 48" DIAMETER 48B4.00.LS EACH $1,856.00
20 COMBINED BASE/CONE UNIT 48CBC3.5 EACH $2,260.00
21 16" MANHOLE RISER---12" 48R1.00S.LS EACH $340.00
22 24" MANHOLE RISER 48R2.00SLS EACH $680.00
23 36" MANHOLE RISER 48R3.00S.LS EACH $1,020.00
24 48" MANHOLE RISER 48R4.00S.LS EACH $1,360.00
25 48" RISER CONE 48CRCA4.0 EACH $1,500.00

$100.00

Exact Transportation Charges, if

*per load (30k Ib minumum) customer to unload

Prepared by E.Andrew 04.13.22
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